
RESULTS
SCANDINAVIAN OPEN YEARLING SALE 2024

YEARLING COUNTRY OF CONSIGNOR COLOUR SEX SIRE DAM DAM'S SIRE CONSIGNOR PURCHASER PRICE DKK NOT SOLD DKK

106 NN (DEN) Denmark Bay Colt Moohaajim Queens Philomatheia Stutteri Hjortebo Cathrine Erichsen 650.000,00
13 NN (DEN) Denmark Bay Colt Appel Au Maitre Whistler Academy Award Stutteri Hjortebo Thomas Velin 520.000,00

100 DAYLIGHT (SWE) Sweden Bay Colt Gleneagles Perfect Day Holy Roman Emperor Stall Sigfridsson AB Thomas Velin 520.000,00
71 NN (SWE) Sweden Bay Filly Lope Y Fernandez Jive Sabiango Long Racing Kajsa Lindsjö 500.000,00
44 NN (DEN) Denmark Bay Colt Red Cactus Eko Palace Bay Siyouni Stutteri Outback Helene Lillelund 330.000,00
52 NN (fr) Denmark Bay Colt Juniper Tree Fire Blaze Dubawi York Stutteri Light Valley Stud 260.000,00
19 NN (DEN) Denmark Chesnut Colt Appel Au Maitre Aladdin's Angel Kendargent Stutteri Hjortebo Søren Jensen 240.000,00

119 NN (SWE) Sweden Bay Colt Japan Seattle Speight Speightstown Long Racing Odo ApS / Hoppe & Co. 240.000,00
36 NN (DEN) Denmark Bay Colt Moohaajim Charter Party Appel Au Maitre Stutteri Hjortebo Richard Venn Bloodstock 225.000,00
74 STOLEN CHERRY (SWE) Sweden Bay Filly Alson Koko Taylor Philomatheia Stall Sigfridsson AB Lennart J:r Reuterskiöld 220.000,00
75 NN (DEN) Denmark Chesnut Filly Red Cactus Koo Koo Sint Mount Nelson Stutteri Hjortebo Jørgens Damsgaard 220.000,00
53 BAHIA MAR (SWE) Sweden Brown Filly Swipe Flip Flopping Fly Orientate Rävdansens Stuteri AB Stald Ras 210.000,00
78 KING VEGA (SWE) Sweden Bay Colt Lucky Vega Levanto Lawman Pernilla Nilsson Patrick Wahl 210.000,00
3 DAX (IRE) Sweden Bay Colt Holy Roman Emperor Lumiere Rose Motivator Stall Morgenstjerne Madeleine Smith 200.000,00

20 MERRY MERRY (SWE) Sweden Brown Filly Make Believe Allure Oasis Dream Stall Morgenstjerne Madeleine Smith 180.000,00
108 NN (DEN) Denmark Bay Colt Juniper Tree Ramone Eishin Dunkirk York Stutteri Light Valley Stud 180.000,00
87 NN (DEN) Denmark Bay Filly Ectot Miss Riverdance Footstepsinthesand Stutteri Hjortebo William Segovia 150.000,00

118 NN (ger) Denmark Bay Colt Hello Youmzain Sanjita Zamindar Morten Nielsen Stald Kabo 150.000,00
2 NN (IRE) Sweden Bay Colt U S Navy Flag Lightning Mark Invincible Spirit Staffan Lidbeck LT Racing 140.000,00

33 NN (DEN) Denmark Brown Colt Juniper Tree Categories Mastercraftsman York Stutteri LT Racing 140.000,00
91 ROGER LEGEND (DEN) Denmark Bay Colt Appel Au Maitre Mylegend Binary File Stutteri Hjortebo Richard Venn Bloodstock 135.000,00
81 NN (DEN) Denmark Bay Filly Appel Au Maitre Malegganda Divine Light Stutteri Hjortebo My Stable 130.000,00
30 NN (DEN) Denmark Grey Filly Moohaajim Baltic Exchange Appel Au Maitre Stutteri Hjortebo Stald Klampenborg 125.000,00
66 NN (SWE) Sweden Grey Colt Toronado I Rely Reliable Man Staffan Lidbeck L Jakobsen & C Petersen 120.000,00
79 SOMETHING ROYAL (SWE) Sweden Bay Filly Swipe Lorca Eishin Dunkirk Rävdansens Stuteri AB Edgar Byrne 100.000,00
59 NN (DEN) Denmark Chesnut Filly Appel Au Maitre Half Heaven Academy Award Stutteri Hjortebo Majbritt Hjort Fielden 95.000,00
26 NN (DEN) Denmark Chesnut Colt Red Cactus Appelé Amour Appel Au Maitre Stutteri Hjortebo Light Valley Stud 90.000,00

131 NN (SWE) Sweden Chesnut Colt Alson Swedish Streak Swedish Shave Eva C S Pettersson Neuroth Racing AS 90.000,00
77 LUX (SWE) Sweden Bay Colt Appel Au Maitre Lana Jolie Whipper Pernilla Nilsson Bettina Andersen 80.000,00

125 MONDIAL (SWE) Sweden Brown Gelding Alson Spiritual Flame Invincible Spirit Stall Sigfridsson AB Väsby Häst AB 80.000,00
60 NN (DEN) Denmark Bay Colt Moohaajim Harmonia Special Quest Morten Nielsen Morten Buskop Bloodstock 70.000,00
70 NN (gb) Sweden Bay Colt U S Navy Flag Island Magic Oasis Dream Eva C S Pettersson Jessica Ohlsson 70.000,00
93 NN (DEN) Denmark Chesnut Colt Giant Sandman Neo Nebula Titus Livius Stutteri Hjortebo Cathrine Erichsen 70.000,00
57 NN (DEN) Denmark Chesnut Filly Al Shemali Golden Memory Dexterity Berner Olsen Søren Jensen 60.000,00
96 NN (DEN) Denmark Bay Colt Moohaajim Noblesse Oblige Alfred Nobel Stutteri Hjortebo Henrik Engblom 60.000,00

114 NN (DEN) Denmark Bay Colt Juniper Tree Rivers Run High Chaparral York Stutteri Elin Ahlin 60.000,00
11 NN (DEN) Denmark Chesnut Colt Giant Sandman Viktoria Dream Cajun Cadet Stutteri Hjortebo Richard Venn Bloodstock 50.000,00
35 NN (DEN) Denmark Chesnut Filly Juniper Tree Charming Loza Lawman York Stutteri Elin Ahlin 50.000,00

104 NN (DEN) Denmark Bay Filly Evasive Princess Harley Dark Angel Black Moon Breeding, Jørgen V. Christensen Madmor Racing 50.000,00
121 NN (DEN) Denmark Grey Colt Juniper Tree Shady Lady Pistachio Berner Olsen Annie Iuul 50.000,00
95 NN (DEN) Denmark Grey Colt Kahyl Noble Fortune Special Quest Berner Olsen Peter Koch 25.000,00

115 NN (DEN) Denmark Chesnut Gelding Girolamo Rosa Nobileo Stutteri Nova Claus Kamstrup 25.000,00
129 NN (DEN) Denmark Bay Colt Juniper Tree Sun City Montjeu Karen Grethe Jensen & Poul Erik Jensen Flemming Salomonsen 25.000,00
132 GLAUCO (SWE) Sweden Bay Colt Elarqam Sweet Pearl Dunaden Christer Svanholm Tobias Hellgren 25.000,00
69 GERT (DEN) Denmark Chesnut Colt Giant Sandman Ina Anjaal Morten Nielsen Charlotte Dencker Hansen 20.000,00
73 NN (DEN) Denmark Bay Filly Juniper Tree Kodachrome Kodiac Stutteri Stork Helene Lillelund 20.000,00

102 NN (DEN) Denmark Chesnut Filly Juniper Tree Pretty Lady Es Que Love Healthy Horse Stud LT Racing 20.000,00
109 NN (DEN) Denmark Chesnut Filly Girolamo Raven Banner Raven's Pass Søren Nissen Mikkel Johansen 20.000,00
116 PRICKLY PEAR (SWE) Sweden Chesnut Filly Red Cactus Saint Irini Dream Ahead Therése Staffansson / Gunnorp Stall & Avel Bent Olsen 20.000,00
58 NN (DEN) Denmark Chesnut Filly Girolamo Good Look Appel Au Maitre Søren Nissen LT Racing 15.000,00
4 NN (FR) Sweden Grey Colt Gutaifan Sweet Travel Danzig Columbus Bloodstock Ambroise Reilly 10.000,00

14 MATILDA (SWE) Sweden Chesnut Filly White Soxs Who's The Tomato Dr Fong Lars Christensson Neuroth Racing AS 10.000,00
16 ZENSATION (SWE) Sweden Bay Filly White Soxs Zenya Hallucinate Lars Christensson Ulf Henriksson 10.000,00
18 JULIUS CAESAR (SWE) Sweden Bay Colt Girolamo Aida Cox Appel Au Maitre Lars-Inge Hägglund Vivika Nilsson 10.000,00



31 MABLE (SWE) Sweden Bay Colt Elarqam Blusher Fraam Christer Svanholm Henrik Engblom 10.000,00
41 NN (DEN) Denmark Bay Colt Girolamo Delayed Footsteps Footstepsinthesand Søren Nissen Helen Nilsson 10.000,00
62 STORMBORN (SWE) Sweden Bay Colt Gale Force Ten High Society Gloria De Campeao Lorab Finance & Stud AB Vivika Nilsson 10.000,00
76 MOJO (SWE) Sweden Bay Colt Moohaajim La Maitresse Appel Au Maitre Therése Staffansson / Gunnorp Stall & Avel Maria Andreasson 10.000,00

130 PERSUASIVE (SWE) Sweden Bay Colt Wentworth Survoltee Helmet Therése Staffansson / Gunnorp Stall & Avel Susanne Johansen 10.000,00
133 NEED TO KNOW (DEN) Denmark Chesnut Filly Nordic Defense Symbol In The Sand Giant Sandman Stutteri Thorskovgaard Flemming Salomonsen 10.000,00
82 NN (DEN) Denmark Bay Filly Juniper Tree Mariyca Daylami York Stutteri Not Sold 190.000,00
21 NN (SWE) Sweden Bay Colt Amaron Altstadt Alkalde Eva C S Pettersson Not Sold 180.000,00
84 NN (DEN) Denmark Bay Filly Red Cactus Meringue Battle Of Marengo Stutteri Hjortebo Not Sold 130.000,00
10 NN (DEN) Denmark Chesnut Colt Juniper Tree Victoria Placa Wootton Bassett York Stutteri Not Sold 120.000,00

113 RUNTOYOU (SWE) Sweden Chesnut Filly Mustajeeb River Of Dreams Eishin Dunkirk Rävdansens Stuteri AB Not Sold 120.000,00
120 BLEEKER STREET (SWE) Sweden Chesnut Filly Swipe Sensitized Street Sense Rävdansens Stuteri AB Not Sold 120.000,00
46 SWEET JANE (SWE) Sweden Bay Filly Swipe Estidraaj Medaglia d'Oro Rävdansens Stuteri AB Not Sold 90.000,00
68 RHYTHMISADANCER (SWE) Sweden Bay Filly Mustajeeb IKC Moneypenny Henrythenavigator Rävdansens Stuteri AB Not Sold 90.000,00
83 NN (SWE) Sweden Bay Filly Cloth Of Stars Marta Appel Au Maitre Stall Cece / Malin Roth Not Sold 90.000,00
98 EQUALIZER (SWE) Sweden Bay Colt Mustajeeb Out Front Swipe Rävdansens Stuteri AB Not Sold 90.000,00
86 PERFECT STORM (DEN) Denmark Bay Filly Juniper Tree Miss Kelly Academy Award Healthy Horse Stud Not Sold 86.000,00

126 ROYAL RUNNER (DEN) Denmark Bay Colt Red Cactus Starlight Runner Pistachio Prøvelyst Equestrian Not Sold 80.000,00
1 NN (IRE) Denmark Chesnut Colt Supremacy Dehbanu King's Best HLK Production Not Sold 70.000,00
7 AVIENDHA (SWE) Sweden Bay Filly Elarqam Tequila Eishin Dunkirk Karin Hammarling Not Sold 70.000,00

32 MAZIKEEN (SWE) Sweden Bay Colt Appel Au Maitre Canyara Dansili Pernilla Nilsson Not Sold 70.000,00
39 BRISCOLA (SWE) Sweden Bay Filly Barocci Corpus Chorister Soldier Of Fortune Therése Staffansson / Gunnorp Stall & Avel Not Sold 70.000,00
40 COPPOLA (SWE) Sweden Bay Colt Barocci Dea Kalejs Eishin Dunkirk Rävdansens Stuteri AB Not Sold 70.000,00
45 NN (SWE) Sweden Bay Colt Japan Elysian Fields Champs Elysees Long Racing Not Sold 70.000,00
47 CASSIDY (SWE) Sweden Bay Colt Swipe Fabergé Philomatheia Rävdansens Stuteri AB Not Sold 70.000,00
99 DEVADEJA (SWE) Sweden Bay Colt Elarqam Paulaya Peintre Celebre Christer Svanholm Not Sold 70.000,00

105 NN (DEN) Denmark Chesnut Filly Al Shemali Prinsessen Dutch Art Stestrup Møllegaard Not Sold 70.000,00
107 HAYLA (SWE) Sweden Bay Filly Swipe Raaqyah Elusive Quality Rävdansens Stuteri AB Not Sold 70.000,00
123 NN (DEN) Denmark Bay Colt Galileo Gold Silver St Cloud No Nay Never Karen Grethe Jensen & Poul Erik Jensen Not Sold 70.000,00
128 NN (DEN) Denmark Bay Filly Make Believe Sultana Gold Sea The Stars Stutteri Thorskovgaard Not Sold 70.000,00

6 TANZZANIA (DEN) Denmark Bay Filly Evasive Tassmania Sir Percy Dean & Mette Olsen Not Sold 60.000,00
9 NN (gb) Sweden Bay Filly Economic Model Vanilla Ice Invincible Spirit Long Racing Not Sold 40.000,00

48 NN (SWE) Sweden Chesnut Colt Juniper Tree Faithfulness Not This Time Ulf Sjöholm Not Sold 40.000,00
49 RED TATOO (SWE) Sweden Chesnut Colt Red Cactus Fancy Legend Pastorius Stall Morgenstjerne Not Sold 40.000,00

101 NN (DEN) Denmark Grey Filly Go Go Gadget Persona Kendargent Stutteri Thorskovgaard Not Sold 40.000,00
110 CROTONE (SWE) Sweden Chesnut Colt Gale Force Ten Rebaba Reliable Man Stall Morgenstjerne Not Sold 40.000,00
28 NN (DEN) Denmark Chesnut Colt Al Shemali Arahat Temple City Stutteri Outback Not Sold 35.000,00
34 CECE CAOL ILA (SWE) Sweden Brown Filly Appel Au Maitre Cece Mackmyra Gloria De Campeao Stall Cece / Malin Roth Not Sold 35.000,00
42 CECE KIND OF MAGIC (SWE) Sweden Chesnut Filly Cloth Of Stars Don't Stop Me Now Zamindar Stall Cece / Malin Roth Not Sold 35.000,00
43 VITTORIA (SWE) Sweden Bay Filly Gale Force Ten Dress To Impress Reliable Man Stall Morgenstjerne Not Sold 35.000,00
50 KISSED BY FIRE (DEN) Denmark Chesnut Filly Girolamo Feens Red Daughter Cajun Cadet Laura & Jeppe M. Hammer Not Sold 35.000,00
51 ROSTARDOZ (SWE) Sweden Chesnut Colt Zaahid Fiery Rose Helsinki Andreas Lydow Not Sold 35.000,00
55 LADY TOULOUSE (SWE) Sweden Brown Filly Moohaajim Fouqueville Le Havre Niklas Alfredsson Not Sold 35.000,00
65 NN (DEN) Denmark Bay Colt Al Shemali Hongkong Paradigm Pistachio Berner Olsen Not Sold 35.000,00
90 NN (DEN) Denmark Bay Filly Red Cactus Monza Footstepsinthesand Stutteri Outback Not Sold 35.000,00

111 BAATMAN (SWE) Sweden Chesnut Colt Red Cactus Reed Door Street Cry Stall Morgenstjerne Not Sold 35.000,00
12 MY MINDS EYE (DEN) Denmark Brown Gelding Go Go Gadget Volver Primatico Stutteri Thorskovgaard Not Sold 30.000,00
15 YALIHOS LAST KID (SWE) Sweden Chesnut Gelding The Honeypot Kid Yaliho Bloom Diaghlyphard Anna Frick Not Sold 30.000,00
38 NN (DEN) Denmark Bay Filly Moohaajim Coolcalmcollected Acclamation Stutteri Hjortebo Not Sold 30.000,00

127 TEN STEPS (SWE) Sweden Brown Filly Gale Force Ten Steps' Divine Footstepsinthesand Stall Morgenstjerne Not Sold 30.000,00
17 JAZOO (SWE) Sweden Chesnut Colt Juniper Tree Zoffy Zoffany Jessica Olsson Not Sold 25.000,00

124 SKYWALK (DEN) Denmark Chesnut Gelding Appel Au Maitre Skyhawk Zaahid Stestrup Møllegaard Not Sold 25.000,00
37 IN CASE OF FIRE (DEN) Denmark Chesnut Filly Red Cactus Code Red Appel Au Maitre Julie Malmros Not Sold 20.000,00

122 MALCOLM THE ROOFER (fr) Denmark Chesnut Colt Appel Au Maitre Shanachloeleah Iffraaj Julie Malmros Not Sold 20.000,00
23 BOLZANO (SWE) Sweden Bay Colt Gale Force Ten Amation Queen Acclamation Stall Morgenstjerne Not Sold 15.000,00
24 VALTER (SWE) Sweden Bay Colt Appel Au Maitre Angel Lane Rajsaman Stålemara Gård AB Not Sold 15.000,00
63 RACY DAISY (SWE) Sweden Chesnut Filly Mkfancy Holy Glory Olympic Glory Stålemara Gård AB Not Sold 15.000,00
80 EPINEPHRINE (SWE) Sweden Bay Filly Appel Au Maitre Lushes Lashes Zaahid Stålemara Gård AB Not Sold 15.000,00
27 CAZADORA (SWE) Sweden Grey Filly Mustajeeb Apura Oasis Dream Therése Staffansson / Gunnorp Stall & Avel Not Sold 10.000,00
56 NN (DEN) Denmark Bay Gelding Go Go Gadget Gaanya Oasis Dream Stutteri Thorskovgaard Not Sold 10.000,00



85 NN (SWE) Sweden Brown Filly Elarqam Miss Bond Danehill Dancer Eva C S Pettersson Not Sold 10.000,00
88 STARSHINE'S GIFT (SWE) Sweden Chesnut Filly Wentworth Models Gift Zoffany Anna Frick Not Sold 10.000,00
94 GINTONIK (DEN) Denmark Chesnut Colt Red Cactus Neverstopdreaming Binary File HLK Production Not Sold 10.000,00

103 STARSHINE'S ROSE (SWE) Sweden Chesnut Filly Wentworth Pretty Pretty Rose Hallucinate Anna Frick Not Sold 10.000,00
5 NN (den) Sweden Chesnut Filly Appel Au Maitre Taja Lord Of England Long Racing WITHDRAWN
8 TIGER'S LILY (SWE) Sweden Grey Filly Gustav Klimt Tiger Goddess Verglas Eva Isacsson Sjunnesson WITHDRAWN

22 ZAAMARA (SWE) Sweden Chesnut Filly Zaahid Amara Center Divider Lorab Finance & Stud AB No Bid
25 SHINE A LIGHT (SWE) Sweden Bay Filly Gleneagles Appel La Légende Appel Au Maitre Eva Isacsson Sjunnesson WITHDRAWN
29 MISS AVALANCHE (SWE) Sweden Brown Filly Swipe Ballouera Discreet Cat Lorab Finance & Stud AB No Bid
54 FORWARD SPIKE (SWE) Sweden Chesnut Gelding Swipe Forward Planning Orientate Eva Isacsson Sjunnesson WITHDRAWN
61 ZABEBAH (SWE) Sweden Bay Filly Red Cactus Hidden Fairytale Bahamian Bounty Stall Morgenstjerne No Bid
64 COLORBLIND (SWE) Sweden Grey Colt Zaahid Honeychurch Reliable Man Andreas Lydow No Bid
67 NN (fr) Denmark Bay Colt Juniper Tree Icecapada Mastercraftsman York Stutteri WITHDRAWN
72 NN (SWE) Sweden Brown Colt Lawman Kalahari Dancer Dalakhani Eva C S Pettersson No Bid
89 NN (DEN) Denmark Bay Filly Appel Au Maitre Mon Fleur Academy Award Stutteri Hjortebo WITHDRAWN
92 JACK OF DIAMONDS (SWE) Sweden Chesnut Gelding Giant Sandman Nastenka Aussie Rules Eva Isacsson Sjunnesson WITHDRAWN
97 POINDEXTER (SWE) Sweden Grey Colt Mustajeeb Ocean's Mist Cape Blanco Rävdansens Stuteri AB WITHDRAWN

112 NYMPHADORA (SWE) Sweden Bay Filly Geniale Risaala Mukhadram Malin Svedare WITHDRAWN
117 NN (SWE) Sweden Bay Filly Appel Au Maitre Sambaheat Camacho Stall Cece / Malin Roth No Bid

Turnover DKK 7.435.000,00 3.166.000,00

Consigned yearlings 124,00

Sold 60,00
Not sold 64,00
Average price DKK 123.916,67

Clearance rate % 48,00


